
PLANNING COMMITTEE Agenda Item 13 
 
Brighton & Hove City Council 

 

  

APPEAL DECISIONS 
 

 Page 

A – SANDRINGHAM LODGE, 23 PALMEIRA AVE, HOVE – 
BRUNSWICK & ADELAIDE  

291 

Application BH2013/00683 – Appeal against refusal for partial roof 
extension for 2No three bedroom penthouse flats each with a private 
roof garden and car space. APPEAL DISMISSED (committee 
decision – 15 March 2013) 
 

 

B – 20-22 MARKET STREET & 9 EAST STREET ARCADE, 
BRIGHTON – REGENCY 

295 

Application BH2013/01279 – Appeal against refusal for change of use 
to restaurant; external plant. APPEAL DISMISSED (delegated 
decision) 
 

 

C – 68A ST GEORGE’S ROAD, BRIGHTON – EAST BRIGHTON 299 

Application BH2013/01529 – Appeal against refusal for demolition of 
the existing building and roof covering over the site. Change of use and 
redevelopment to provide 3 x 3 bedroom houses with associated 
landscaping. APPEAL DISMISSED & COSTS REFUSED (delegated 
decision) 
 

 

D – THE ATLAS, 253 OLD SHOREHAM ROAD, HOVE – 
HANGLETON & KNOLL  

307 

Application BH2013/03554 – Appeal against refusal for erection of a 
ground floor single storey extension to the rear garden area. APPEAL 
DISMISSED (delegated decision) 
 

 

E – 199/201 OLD SHOREHAM ROAD, HOVE – HOVE PARK 
 

309 

Applications BH2013/00521 – Appeal against refusal for erection of a 
detached building containing ground floor two bedroom flat and 
first/second floor three bedroom maisonette. APPEAL DISMISSED 
(delegated decision) 
 

 

F – LAND ADJACENT TO 42 ROSEBERY AVENUE, 
WOODINGDEAN, BRIGHTON – WOODINGDEAN 

313 

Application BH2013/01377 – Appeal against refusal for new detached 
residential dwelling. APPEAL DISMISSED (delegated decision) 
 

 

G – 64 WELBECK AVENUE, HOVE - WISH 
 

317 

Applications BH2013/04037 – Appeal against refusal for raised wooden 
decking to the rear of the property, to be flush with the rear lounge floor 
level. APPEAL ALLOWED (delegated decision) 
 

 



H – 10 PRINCES CRESCENT, HOVE – WESTBOURNE   319 

Application BH2013/04233 – Appeal against refusal for construction of 
a vehicle crossover to access a proposed, off road, vehicle parking 
area on the right hand side of the front of a detached property and 
alterations to the existing front wall. APPEAL ALLOWED (delegated 
decision) 
 

 

I – 157 SHIRLEY DRIVE, HOVE – HOVE PARK 323 

Application BH2014/04324 – Appeal against refusal for gable roof 
extension to the front elevation including increased ridge height. 
Installation of new windows and doors and creation of balcony to first 
floor front elevation. APPEAL DISMISSED (delegated decision) 
 

 

J – 70 GREENWAYS, OVINGDEAN, BRIGHTON – ROTTINGDEAN 
COASTAL  

325 

Application BH2013/04267 – Appeal against refusal for remodelling of 
bungalow to form house. APPEAL DISMISSED (delegated decision) 
 

 

 


